
  Co-funded by European Union  
 
To: FIEC members, SOC groups members, DESOCO participants 

 

INVITATION 
SuSodCo virtual Capacity Building Event 

Seminar (09 Dec 2020) and Workshop (16 Dec 2020) 
 

Dear Madam/Sir, 

The SUSODCO consortium is delighted to invite you to the first virtual Capacity Building Event, part of 
SuSodCo project, which is aimed to equip social dialogue partners with crucial capacities to facilitate the 
effective and efficient industrial relations in Central and South-eastern Europe. The host of the initiative is the 
Trade Union of Construction Industry of Croatia (SGH).  

The first Capacity Building Event of the project is divided into two sessions – seminar and workshop.  

The seminar, planned for 09 Dec 2020 from 9:00 am until 12:00 pm (CET), will focus on the key findings of 
the research phase of SuSodCo project, unveiling the social dialogue challenges faced by the construction 
industry in Bulgaria, Croatia, Cyprus, Greece, Hungary and Slovenia. Prominent panelists from renown 
European institutions will illustrate the international context of the social dialogue and present the recent 
developments in the digitalization of the construction sector, workplace productivity, and the social dialogue 
benefits for the construction industry. For more details about the panelists and the presentation topics, please 
have a look at the attached draft agenda. 

The workshop, planned for 16 Dec 2020 from 9:00 am until 11:00 am (CET), will involve employers’ and 
employees’ representatives in an interactive session, looking at the different ways of how to integrate the 
European social dialogue framework in their own national multiannual social dialogue programmes. The online 
collaboration tool (Miro) will facilitate virtual teamwork. There will be an orientation and short online training 
session for using the Miro tool prior to the workshop. 

Please register for participation at both events at the registration links provided in the agenda. The event 
will be held on the Zoom video conference platform and you will receive the respective links upon registering 
to the sessions. The official language of the seminar and the workshop is English. We will be able to provide 
translation for the seminar during the first day; however, you should specify your language request in the 
registration link the latest by 1 Dec 2020.  

We are looking forward to seeing you at the first SuSodCo Capacity Building Event to exchange insights and 
interesting ideas on how to work together to achieve our common social dialogue objectives on a national and 
European level. 

23 November 2020 

Sincerely, 

The SUSODCO consortium   
susodco.eu                                                                                                           


